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1 ea. UNIT
Pipe Cut-Off Saw, Portable, Hydraulic Powered, Mfg: E.H. Wachs; PRICE 22,500.00 25,000.00 33,301.630
P/N 02-000-02 or approved equal TOTAL 22,500.00 25,000.00 33,301.630 NO BID
EH Wachs
1. Make/Model Mfg/Model 02-000-02 25-000-03
1 ea. UNIT
Saw, Carbide Tipped, 7" x 3/16" Diameter for Ductile, Cast & Cement Line PRICE 750.00 805.56 742.99
Pipe Up to 1 - 1/2" Wal, Mfg: E.H. Wachs, P/N 02-606-00 or approved equal |[TOTAL 750.00 805.56 742.99 NO BID
EH Wachs
2. Make/Model Mfg/Model 02-606-00
4 ea. UNIT
Diamond Wire Guillotine Package for 4" - 16" Diameter, Mfg: E.H. Wachs, PRICE 9,995.00 11,105.56 10,309.72
P/N 29-000-10 or approved equals TOTAL 39,980.00 44,422.24 41,238.88 NO BID
EH Wachs
3. Make/Model Mfg/Model 29-000-10
4 ea. UNIT
Diamond Wire Loop Assembly, High Density, Mfg: E.H. Wachs; PRICE 745.00 827.78 769.30
P/N 29-601-10 or approved equals TOTAL 2,980.00 3,311.12 3,077.20 NO BID
4, Make/Model Mfg/Model EH Wachs
UNIT
4 ea. PRICE 125.00 138.89 129.36
Liner, Drive Wheel, Mfg: E.H. Wachs; P/N 29-010-04-03 or approved equal  [TOTAL 500.00 555.56 517.44 NO BID
5. Make/Model Mfg/Model EH Wachs EH Wachs
Freight
953.32
TOTAL TOTAL 67,663.32 74,094.48 78,878.14 NO BID
Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days 30-45 days 21-28 days 3-4 weeks
*LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Dealers Electric Ferguson Water Works Demandstar
Alamo Iron Works Lone Star Int SAWS Website

Bay Tech
Bullchase
EH Wachs
Fastenal

Meister Supply

Sunbelt Mill
Wesco Dist.




